
Bid Tabulation 

ITB 31-19 FOOD SERVICE DISPOSABLE SUPPLIES

Sandra Tellis, Principal Buyer -Ph:205-325-8707/E: telliss@jccal.org

DESCRIPTION 
*Or Approved Equal PACK PRICE PACK PRICE

1 Knife, plastic, 6”, heavy wrapped, 1000/cs, white or black 21.10$         30.59$         
Units Per Pack 1000 1,000
Packages Per Case 1 1
Brand             Max Pkg Max Pac
Vendor Item No 50KBW 8484364

2

Forks, plastic, 6”, heavy weight, wrapped, 1000/cs, white 

or black 21.10$         30.59$         
Units Per Pack 1,000 1,000
Packages Per Case 1 1
Brand             Max Pkg Max Pac
Vendor Item No 5040480 0674806

3

Spoons, plastic, 6”, heavy weight, wrapped, 1000/cs, white 

or black 21.00$         30.59$         
Units Per Pack 1,000 1,000
Packages Per Case 1 1
Brand             Max Pkg Max Pac
Vendor Item No 50SBW 8484384

4

Knife, fork, spoon set, 6”, heavy weight, wrapped, 500 

set/cs 34.75$         33.02$         
Units Per Pack 500 250
Packages Per Case 1 1
Brand             Max Pkg Max Pac
Vendor Item No 7050B 1947268

5

Polystyrene fork, bulk, 10 x 100/cs, Sweetheart #SEL75FK, 

* 23.40$         25.08$         
Units Per Pack 100 1,000
Packages Per Case 10 1
Brand             Max Pkg Sys Cls
Vendor Item No 2705J-B1 8003370

6

Polystyrene knife, bulk, 10 x 100/cs, Sweetheart, #SEL6KN 

* 23.40$         25.08$         
Units Per Pack 100 1,000
Packages Per Case 10 1
Brand             Max Pkg Sys Cls
Vendor Item No 2704J-B1 7963467

7

Polystyrene spoon, bulk, 10 x 100/cs, Sweetheart #SEL7TS, 

* 23.40$         25.08$         
Units Per Pack 100 1,000
Packages Per Case 10 1
Brand             Max Pkg Sys Cls
Vendor Item No 2706J-B1 8003418

CENTRAL PAPER
1

GROUP 1:  FORKS, SPOONS, KNIVES, PLATES, BOWLS AND CONTAINERS

2
SYSCO



DESCRIPTION 
*Or Approved Equal PACK PRICE PACK PRICE

CENTRAL PAPER
1 2

SYSCO

8 Plate, plastic, 9”, 500/cs, Dart #9PWF, Amoco #36-791, * 32.25$         64.09$         
Units Per Pack 125 18
Packages Per Case 4 10
Brand             Dart Sys Cls
Vendor Item No 1720457 7945223

9 Plate, plastic, 6”, 500/cs, Dart #6PWF, * 30.40$         27.68$         
Units Per Pack 125 18
Packages Per Case 8 10
Brand             Dart Sys Cls
Vendor Item No 1720450 7945041

10

Bowl, plastic, 5 oz., 1000/cs, Sweetheart #RS5DB, Amoco 

#36-705,* 30.40$         No Bid
Units Per Pack 125
Packages Per Case 8
Brand             Dart
Vendor Item No 1720405

11

Clear hinged lid container, one compartment, 9” x 7” x 2 

3/4", 250/cs, #C90HT1,* 39.50$         32.56$         
Units Per Pack 125 100
Packages Per Case 2 2
Brand             Dart Sys Cls
Vendor Item No 1720580 2310102

12

Clear, plastic, hinged container, 5” medium deep, 500/cs, 

Tenneco #CI8-1050 ,* 37.90$         31.38$         
Units Per Pack 125 125
Packages Per Case 4 3
Brand             Dart Sys Cls
Vendor Item No 1720567 2309567

13 7” Clear, plastic plates 40.50$         No Bid
Units Per Pack 20
Packages Per Case 12
Brand             WNA
Vendor Item No OP75240CL

GROUP 1 TOTAL 379.10$       355.74$       

GROUP 1:  FORKS, SPOONS, KNIVES, PLATES, BOWLS AND CONTAINERS  - Continued



DESCRIPTION 
*Or Approved Equal PACK PRICE PACK PRICE

CENTRAL PAPER
1 2

SYSCO

14

Sandwich container, Styrofoam, hinged lid, 6” x 6” x 3”, 

500/cs, Amoco #80-600, GenPak #22500, * 19.25$         20.69$         
Units Per Pack 125 500
Packages Per Case 4 1
Brand             GENPAK SYS TRAZ
Vendor Item No 2660388 7336805

15

Carryout tray, 3 compartment, Styrofoam, hinged lid, 

200/cs, Amoco #36-583-B, Dart #954T3, * 15.40$         11.99$         
Units Per Pack 100 150
Packages Per Case 2 1
Brand             GENPAK SYS CLS
Vendor Item No 2660362 7551324

16 5 oz. Bowl, 1000/cs, Dart #5B20, * 25.80$         32.09$         
Units Per Pack 20 125
Packages Per Case 50 10
Brand             CONVERMEX SYS REL
Vendor Item No 170270 7831581

17 10 oz. Bowl, 1000/cs, Dart #10B20, * 33.25$         25.39$         
Units Per Pack 20 125
Packages Per Case 50 8
Brand             CONVERMEX SYS CLS
Vendor Item No 170276 0685901

18 8 oz. Cup, 1000/cs, Dart #8J8, * 16.80$         19.36$         
Units Per Pack 40 40
Packages Per Case 25 25
Brand             CONVERMEX SYS CLS
Vendor Item No 170008 2769156

19 10 oz. cup, 1000/cs, Dart #10J12, * 27.60$         24.67$         
Units Per Pack 25 40
Packages Per Case 40 25
Brand             DART SYS CLS
Vendor Item No 1720014 2769160

20 12 oz. cup, 1000/cs, Dart #12J12, * 29.25$         31.25$         
Units Per Pack 25 40
Packages Per Case 40 25
Brand             DART SYS CLS
Vendor Item No 1720017 2769184

GROUP 2:  STYROFOAM/POLYSTYRENE AND WAX/LAMINATED ITEMS (INCLUDING LIDS FOR CUPS)



DESCRIPTION 
*Or Approved Equal PACK PRICE PACK PRICE

CENTRAL PAPER
1 2

SYSCO

21

16 oz paper, waxed cold drink cup, 1000/cs, Sweetheart 

#R16, * 77.00$         78.32$         
Units Per Pack 50 50
Packages Per Case 20 24
Brand             DART SYS TRAZ
Vendor Item No SOLRW16 1993726

22 16 oz. cup, 1000/cs, Dart #16J16, * 17.20$         45.59$         
Units Per Pack 25 25
Packages Per Case 20 40
Brand             CONVERMEX SYSCO
Vendor Item No 170016 4360855

23 32 oz. cup, 500/cs, Dart 32TJ32, * 31.60$         37.62$         
Units Per Pack 25 25
Packages Per Case 20 20
Brand             CONVERMEX SYS CLS
Vendor Item No 170033 2770291

24 6 oz. cup, 1000/cs, Dart #6J6 , * 15.20$          16.53$         
Units Per Pack 25 40
Packages Per Case 40 $25.00
Brand             CONVERMEX SYS CLS
Vendor Item No 170006 2769141

25 Lid, 6 oz. cup, 1000/cs, Dart #6JL , * 13.15$         12.59$         
Units Per Pack 100 100
Packages Per Case 10 10
Brand             DART PACTIV
Vendor Item No 1720205 2976005

26 Lid, 8 oz. cup, 1000/cs, Dart #8JL, * 13.50$         18.24$         
Units Per Pack 100 100
Packages Per Case 10 10
Brand             DART PACTIV
Vendor Item No 1720212 2975011

27 Lid, 10 oz. & 12 oz cup, 1000/cs, Dart #12JL, * 16.90$         NO BID
Units Per Pack 100
Packages Per Case 10
Brand             DART
Vendor Item No 1720222

GROUP 2:  STYROFOAM/POLYSTYRENE AND WAX/LAMINATED ITEMS (INCLUDING LIDS FOR CUPS) - Continued



DESCRIPTION 
*Or Approved Equal PACK PRICE PACK PRICE

CENTRAL PAPER
1 2

SYSCO

28 Lid, 20 oz Cup, 1000/cs, Dart #20JL, * 19.85$         17.58$         
Units Per Pack 100 100
Packages Per Case 10 10
Brand             CONVERMEX PACTIV
Vendor Item No 170153 2777561

29 Lid, 32 oz. Cup, 1000/cs, Dart #32JL , * 17.00$         21.99$         
Units Per Pack 50 75
Packages Per Case 10 14
Brand             CONVERMEX PACTIV
Vendor Item No LV32 3270388

30 Straw slot lid, 16 oz Cup, 1000/cs, Dart #16SL, * 16.25$         19.68$         
Units Per Pack 100 100
Packages Per Case 10 10
Brand             CONVERMEX DART
Vendor Item No 170156 4096327

31 3.5 oz Bowl, 1000/cs, Sweetheart #RS3.5BY, * 47.00$         55.61$         
Units Per Pack 125 125
Packages Per Case 8 8
Brand             DART DART
Vendor Item No 35BWWQ 5361258

32 12 oz bowl, 1000/cs, Sweetheart #RS12BY, * 26.35$         18.15$         
Units Per Pack 125 125
Packages Per Case 8 8
Brand             DART SYS REL
Vendor Item No SOLRS12BNWH 7932785

33 6” plate, 1000/cs, Sweetheart #RS6CY, * 28.55$         15.41$         
Units Per Pack 125 125
Packages Per Case 8 8
Brand             DART SYS REL
Vendor Item No DRT6PWQ 8615753

34 7” x 9” foam platter, 500/cs, Sweetheart #RS79PY, * 38.35$         50.13$         
Units Per Pack 125 125
Packages Per Case 4 4
Brand             DART DART
Vendor Item No 9PRWQR 2880833

GROUP 2:  STYROFOAM/POLYSTYRENE AND WAX/LAMINATED ITEMS (INCLUDING LIDS FOR CUPS) - Continued
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CENTRAL PAPER
1 2

SYSCO

35 9” foam compartment plate, 500/cs, Sweetheart #RS9CY, * 30.50$         14.91$         
Units Per Pack 125 125
Packages Per Case 4 4
Brand             DART SYS REL
Vendor Item No DRT9PWQ 5274840

36 Service tray foam, 16” x 12”, 100/cs Gen Pak #11216, * 22.80$         45.09$         
Units Per Pack 100 100
Packages Per Case 1 1
Brand             GENPAK PACTIV
Vendor Item No 2665210 7254568

GROUP 2 TOTAL 598.55$       632.88$       

37

Aluminum foil H.D., 18” x 1000 ft, Reynolds #625, Alumax 

#125, * 48.00$         68.65$         
Units Per Pack 1 1
Packages Per Case 1 1
Brand             HFA SYS CLS
Vendor Item No 302026 6938377

38 Aluminum foil H.D., 18” x 500 ft, Reynolds #624, * 24.00$         28.06$         
Units Per Pack 1 1
Packages Per Case 1 1
Brand             HFA SYS CLS
Vendor Item No 302056 6937767

39 Vinyl wrap, 11” x 11”, 1700 Pages/roll, Reynolds #928, * 8.30$           NO BID
Units Per Pack 1,700
Packages Per Case 1
Brand             ANCHOR
Vendor Item No 091505

40 Plastic film, 18” x 2000 ft, Reynolds #914, Bordon, * 13.40$         13.58$         
Units Per Pack 1 1
Packages Per Case 1 1
Brand             ANCHOR SYS CLS
Vendor Item No 091202 7435266

41 Waxed paper, 12” x 250 ft, Reynolds #7955, * 29.75$         25.52$         
Units Per Pack 6 X 75' 1
Packages Per Case 1 1
Brand             CUTRITE SYS IMP
Vendor Item No 725111 0444117

GROUP 2:  STYROFOAM/POLYSTYRENE AND WAX/LAMINATED ITEMS (INCLUDING LIDS FOR CUPS) - Continued

GROUP 3:  PLASTIC WRAP/VINYL WRAP/ALUMINUM FOIL, WAXED PAPER, FREEZER PAPER, BROWN KRAFT 

WRAPPING PAPER, SANDWICH BAGS



DESCRIPTION 
*Or Approved Equal PACK PRICE PACK PRICE

CENTRAL PAPER
1 2

SYSCO

42

Freezer paper, white, poly coated, 18” x 1000 ft, Network 

#7431, Southwest James River #KL18, * 41.60$         NO BID
Units Per Pack 1
Packages Per Case 1
Brand             DIXIE
Vendor Item No 725115

43

Brown Kraft wrapping paper, 18”, 40 lb. Sub. Brock Board 

#33230, * 13.25$         19.88$         
Units Per Pack 1 1
Packages Per Case 1 1
Brand             BOCKSBOARD SYSCO

Vendor Item No 580035

9752577 (White 

Paper)

44 Sandwich bags, waxed, 10 x 10, 2000/cs, * 26.25$         85.06$         
Units Per Pack 1000 1000
Packages Per Case 1 6
Brand             BROWN PAPER REYNOLD
Vendor Item No 711-NR 4446431

45

Pop-up foil Pages, 9” x 10 3/4", 500 pages/box, Alcan, 

Accumax #141, * 46.80$         58.04$         
Units Per Pack 500 500
Packages Per Case 6 6
Brand             HFA SYSCO
Vendor Item No 302074 6938500

46

Vinyl gloves, dietary use, powder free, 100/bx, 10 

boxes/cs, Memphis Glove #5000, * 20.00$         24.55$         
Units Per Pack 100 100
Packages Per Case -Small 10 10
Packages Per Case -Medium 10 10
Packages Per Case -Large 10 10
Brand             TRADEX SYS REL

Vendor Item No V5201

0951980, 0951998, 

0952004

GROUP 3 TOTAL 271.35$       323.34$       

47

Dispenser Napkins, Cafeteria,  7 1/4” x 13 1/2”, 10,1000/cs, 

Hy-Nap; Tri-fold 30.60$         32.88$         
Units Per Pack 500 250
Packages Per Case 20 40
Brand             CASCADE SYS CLS
Vendor Item No 4730280 4458564

GROUP 4:  MISCELLANEOUS

GROUP 3:  PLASTIC WRAP/VINYL WRAP/ALUMINUM FOIL, WAXED PAPER, FREEZER PAPER, BROWN KRAFT 

WRAPPING PAPER, SANDWICH BAGS - Continued
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*Or Approved Equal PACK PRICE PACK PRICE

CENTRAL PAPER
1 2

SYSCO

48

Dinner Napkins, 1/8 fold; single ply, 17” x 17”, 5000/cs, 

Network #510, Scott #981800, Texnap #320, * 39.15$         71.72$         
Units Per Pack 250 334
Packages Per Case 20 12
Brand             CAROLINA/CT TORK
Vendor Item No 43506 6086413 (1/4 Fold)

49

Dispenser Napkins, 13” x 17”, 6000/cs, Scott #98730, Jas 

River #250, Ft. Howard Mornap #374, Crown #483, Erving 

#7138, * 49.65$         48.21$         
Units Per Pack 250 250
Packages Per Case 24 24
Brand             GEORGIA PACIFIC MORNAD SYS CLS

Vendor Item No 33137406 4458552

50 Straws, wrapped, 7 3/4”, 24/500’s/cs, Cardinal #11684, * 48.48$         59.79$         
Units Per Pack 500 500
Packages Per Case 24 24
Brand             CARDINAL SYS CLS

Vendor Item No 510025 0191567

51

Straws, flex, 7 3/4", wrapped, 24/500’s/cs, Cardinal 

#11685, * 48.40$         76.04$         
Units Per Pack 400 400
Packages Per Case 25 24
Brand             CARDINAL SYS CLS

Vendor Item No 569276 0191897

52

Cup, cold drink paper, 12 oz., 2500/cs, Sweetheart #r12, 

Lilly #1257, * 107.75$       NO BID
Units Per Pack 100
Packages Per Case 20
Brand             DART

Vendor Item No SOLR12N

53

Food handler gloves, polyethylene, disposable, 100/pkg, 

Memphis Glove #504, * 31.00$         12.13$         
Units Per Pack 500 500
Packages Per Case 20 4
Brand             TRADEX SYS REL
Vendor Item No 462303 8348740

GROUP 4:  MISCELLANEOUS - Continued



DESCRIPTION 
*Or Approved Equal PACK PRICE PACK PRICE

CENTRAL PAPER
1 2

SYSCO

54

Latex gloves, cleaning, size 10, Impact Pro. #8217, 

Memphis Glove #5299* 5.40$           100.95$       
Units Per Pack 12 12
Packages Per Case 1 12
Brand             TRADEX ROYAL

Vendor Item No 462114 6426282

55

Water cup, flat bottom, 4.5 oz., 5000/cs, Lilly #450, Gen 

Pak #450-F, * 57.50$         NO BID
Units Per Pack 100
Packages Per Case 25
Brand             GENPAK

Vendor Item No 2660474

56 Stir Stick, wooden, wrapped, 10/500’s/cs, Forrester #318, * 55.60$         16.86$         
Units Per Pack 500 1000
Packages Per Case 10 5
Brand             ROYAL HANGARD

Vendor Item No 464240

2104998 (Not 

Wrapped)

57

Aprons, polyethylene, embossed, white, heavy weight, 28” 

x 46”, 100/bx, Ling #419, * 6.35$           37.93$         
Units Per Pack 100 100
Packages Per Case 1 5
Brand             HOSPECO SYS CLS

Vendor Item No 443151 5330873

58

Paper towels, natural (brown), single fold, 10” x 10”, James 

River #812, Tagson   #5090, Bay West #470 , * 13.75$         17.34$         
Units Per Pack 250 250
Packages Per Case 16 16
Brand             ESSITY (SCA) SYS CLS

Vendor Item No 3355100 4458671

59 Coasters, Greek Key Coasters, 1000/cs, 2 1/4" dia, *  $         60.00  NO BID 
Units Per Pack 1000
Packages Per Case 1
Brand             ROYAL

Vendor Item No CAC171

GROUP 4:  MISCELLANEOUS - Continued
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*Or Approved Equal PACK PRICE PACK PRICE

CENTRAL PAPER
1 2

SYSCO

60 Party tumblers, clear,  hard plastic 7 oz, 500/cs, *  $         54.75  $         49.28 
Units Per Pack 50 25
Packages Per Case 20 20
Brand             DART COMET

Vendor Item No SOLTP7 4282737

61

Plastic table covers, disposable, white, 108” x 54”, 25/cs, 

Tablemate, *  $         36.00  $         46.11 
Units Per Pack 25 25
Packages Per Case 1 1
Brand             HOFFMASTER SYSCO
Vendor Item No 4941620 5875323

62 Aprons, bibs, cotton/poly, Intg 335W, *  $         51.60  $         15.69 
Units Per Pack 12 6
Packages Per Case 1 1
Brand             DALIX SYSCO

Vendor Item No APN002W 2764017

63 Hot pads, Benk-PGI-Imp , *  $         18.00  $           5.79 
Units Per Pack 1 3
Packages Per Case 1 1
Brand             SAN JAMAR SYSCO

Vendor Item No UHP77BK 2764108

64 Pan liner 16 x 24, Quilon 205, *  $         37.00  $         35.04 
Units Per Pack 1000 1000
Packages Per Case 1 1
Brand             BROWN PAPER SYS CLS

Vendor Item No 040405 7157365

65

Fuel Wick Safe, Standard size, 24/cs (Fuel wick only not the 

gel)  $         32.05  $         30.60 
Units Per Pack 24 24
Packages Per Case 1 1
Brand             DIABLO SYSCO

Vendor Item No S70103 4783496

GROUP 4:  MISCELLANEOUS - Continued



DESCRIPTION 
*Or Approved Equal PACK PRICE PACK PRICE

CENTRAL PAPER
1 2

SYSCO

66 Paper bag, Silverware, White 2000/CS  $         19.15  $           7.61 
Units Per Pack 2000 2000
Packages Per Case 1 1
Brand             BROWN PAPER HANGARD

Vendor Item No 040700 5182522 (Clear Bag)

67 Towels, Food Service 12 x 24  $         34.00  $         38.26 
Units Per Pack 150 150
Packages Per Case 1 1
Brand             GEORGIA -PACIFIC CHIX

Vendor Item No 33129424 4490587

68 Caps, Bouffant food handler 21”  $         23.25  $         13.71 
Units Per Pack 100 100
Packages Per Case 10 5
Brand             ROYAL SYS CLS
Vendor Item No 464360 2098205

69 Pads, Scouring, Heavy Duty 6X9 13.50$         8.91$           
Units Per Pack 10 18
Packages Per Case 6 1
Brand             ACS SYSCO

Vendor Item No 705730 1376862

70 Cup Paper Soufflé, 2 oz F-200, *  $         38.00  $         33.91 
Units Per Pack 250 250
Packages Per Case 20 10
Brand             GENPAK SYS CLS

Vendor Item No 2660462 7931181

71 Cup Plastic tran portion 3.5 oz. 39.30$         44.82$         
Units Per Pack 125 200
Packages Per Case 20 12
Brand             NETCHOICE SYS REL

Vendor Item No NET151321 7794676

GROUP 4:  MISCELLANEOUS - Continued
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*Or Approved Equal PACK PRICE PACK PRICE

CENTRAL PAPER
1 2

SYSCO

72 Doily, lace round 10”  $         28.50  $         21.53 
Units Per Pack 1000 1000
Packages Per Case 1 1
Brand             HOFFMASTER SYSCO

Vendor Item No 4942555 9718040

73 Doily, lace round 12”  $         33.50  NO BID 
Units Per Pack 1000
Packages Per Case 1
Brand             HOFFMASTER

Vendor Item No 4942560

74 Lid for 3.45 oz.  plastic soufflé  $         34.10  $         34.11 
Units Per Pack 125 120
Packages Per Case 20 20
Brand             NETCHOICE SYS LMP

Vendor Item No NET01362 7793736

75 Tray mats embossed white 14 x 19  $         43.75  NO BID 
Units Per Pack 1000
Packages Per Case 1
Brand             HOFFMASTER

Vendor Item No 4942090

76

Baking cups, 4 1/2" circle, 500/bx, SK015CX, Reynolds 

#TW452, *  $         51.40  $         49.42 
Units Per Pack 500 500
Packages Per Case 20 20
Brand             HOFFMASTER HOFMASTER

Vendor Item No 4942615 4418687

77 Hairnet, Size-Large, Black or Brown 10.15$         142.22$       
Units Per Pack 144 144
Packages Per Case 1 10
Brand             ROYAL ROYAL

Vendor Item No 464355 8631218 (Brown)

GROUP 4:  MISCELLANEOUS - Continued
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CENTRAL PAPER
1 2

SYSCO

78 4.5 X 1 White Napkin Bands  $           7.60  $         28.07 
Units Per Pack 2500 2500
Packages Per Case 1 4
Brand             ROYAL ROYAL

Vendor Item No 464505 9413402

79 Foam Tray 14 x 18  $         28.70  $         41.74 
Units Per Pack 100 100
Packages Per Case 1 1
Brand             GENPAK PACTIV
Vendor Item No 2665220 4056529

GROUP 4 TOTAL 1,187.93$   1,120.67$   

GRAND TOTAL GROUPS 1-4 2,436.93$   2,432.63$   

MINIMUM ORDER REQUIREMENT
DELIVERY IS GUARANTEED NOT LATER THAN
ALL OR NONE OFFER
DELIVERY WILL BE MADE BY 

PACA MEMBERS DELIVERY EXCEPTIONS

1.  Central Paper Co, Inc / 140 West Oxmoor Road; Homewood, AL 35209 / Erick Petterson - 205-942-6333
2.  Sysco Foods /1000 Sysco Drive; Calera, AL 35040/ Daniel Chambless - 205-668-7001

GROUP 4:  MISCELLANEOUS - Continued

$250.00
5-7 Days

500
7-10 Days

NO YES
Bidder or Commercial Truck Bidder Truck

Orders < $250 are accepted with a 

$15 delivery fee Bidder Truck

REQUIRED FORMS CENTRAL PAPER SYSCO FOODS
1 2

EQUAL EMPLOYMENT OPPORTUNITY CERTIFICATION FORM
DEBARMENT STATEMENT
SIGNATURE PAGE

AMENDMENT 1

BID FORM
EXPERIENCE STATEMENT
NOTIFICATION OF INTENT TO RESPOND
NON-COLLUSION AFFIDAVIT
AFFIDAVIT OF CONTRACTOR

Yes
Yes
Yes

Yes

Yes
Yes
Yes
Yes
Yes

Yes
Yes
Yes

Yes

Yes
Yes
Yes
Yes
Yes

AMENDMENT 2 Yes Yes

PACA DOCUMENTS YesYes


